
Freedom of Information Request - Housing stock repainting 

Date received – 02/05/23 

 

Request: 

 
1. The average frequency with which you repaint the exterior of the 
homes that you own. 
 
2. The number of homes that you own that you repainted the exterior of 
in the financial year 2022/23. 
 
3. The number of homes that you own that you repainted the exterior of 
in the financial year 2022/23 using graphene paint. 
 
4. The number of homes that you own that you repainted the exterior of 
in the financial year 2022/23 with fungicidal anti-damp paints other 
than graphene. 
 
5. The number of homes that you own that you repainted the exterior of 
in the financial year 2022/23 using conventional paint. 
 
6. The expenditure on repainting the exterior of the homes that you 
own in the financial year 2022/23 including (if recorded) a breakdown 
of the cost of paint, labour and scaffolding. 
 
7. The expenditure on remedying or treating damp and/or mould in the 
homes that you own in the financial year 2022/23. 

 

Response: 

We do not hold any information as Eastleigh Borough Council do not hold or manage any housing 
stock. 


